CITY OF NORTH

 Loevillp

EST 1810
TABULATIONS FOR BID
To: Bonded Chemicals, Inc. State: OH
From: French Creek WWTP
Opened: April 17, 2025
We are providing information for bid tabulation on the bids received.
Awarded:ées)NO (circle one)
If Yes, indicated award with a *
If No, indicate expected date of award.
Participants Product Price/Gallon Results
Bonded Chemicals, Inc Sodium Hypochlorite and | See Attached Bid Amounts | *Awarded to Bonded
Sodium Bisulfite Chemicals, Inc.
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc | Sodium Hypochlorite and | See Attached Bid Amounts
Sodium Bisulfite
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FRENCH CREEK WASTEWATER 2350 Abbe Road (440) 934-5251
Sheffield Village, OH 44054 nridgeville.org

TREATMENT PLANT



BID AMOUNTS FOR BID TABULATION ON BID RECEIVED:

Bonded Chemicals, Inc.:

Sodium Hypochlorite Prices, Package, Quantity/Delivered

$2.36/Gallon $778.80 per 330 gal Tote/delivered,
$2.44/Gallon $134.20 55 gal/delivered,
$2.89/Gallon $43.35 15gal/delivered,
$2.89/Gallon $86.70 30 gal/delivered,
$7.00/Gallon $28.00 1 gal 4/case/delivered,
$2.36/Gallon $708.00 300 gal/delivered.

and Sodium Bisulfite Prices, Package, Quantity/Delivered
| $147.00 - $ .2450/1b. |

Per 600 LB drum/delivered |

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc.:

Sodium Hypochlorite Prices, Package, Quantity/Delivered

- $864.60 per 330 gal Tote/delivered,
- $144.16 55 gal/delivered,
- $51.00 15gal/delivered,
- $96.00 30 gal/delivered,
NO BID NO BID 1 gal 4/case/delivered,
NO BID NO BID 300 gal/delivered.

and Sodium Bisulfite Prices, Package, Quantity/Delivered

$150.00

Per 600 LB drum/delivered [




